August 17, 2006



Mr. Richard Chavez, Assoc. Superintendent for Support Services Gadsden Independent School District PO Drawer 70 Anthony, NM 88021

RE:

DCU Projects at 16 Schools – 2006 Gadsden Independent School District

Dear Mr. Chavez,

On August 10, 2006 three bids were received for the above referenced project. As shown on the attached Bid Tabulation sheet the low bid was from DND Contractors Inc. for \$1,303,000.00 which is within our estimate and funds available from the Public School Financial Authority. One of the other bidders requested clarification on the lack of listing of a window blind subcontractor, but discussion with the Contractor confirmed that DND did comply.

DND is currently building Chaparral High School and their work has consistently met drawings and specification requirements, is on schedule, and they are working well with GISD and our firm. We recommend acceptance of their bid, and awarding them a contract for \$1,303,000.00.

Long transport of a control of the creative Problem of the act of the control of th

Sincerely,

Rembert C Alley Ir AIA

Cc: Ron Haugen, Superintendent, GISD

Pamela Wright, Purchasing Agent, GISD David Boyd, Director of Construction, GISD

Tyler Daniels, Vice President, DND Contractors, Inc.

X



BID TABULATION

1691 HICKORY LOOP, STE. A LAS CRUCES, NEW MEXICO 88005 (505) 523-1310

ARCHITEC T-PLANNERS

PROJECT: DCU AT 16 SCHOOLS - 2006

GADSDEN INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

BID DATE:

AUGUST 10, 2006

BID TIME:

2:00 PM

Base Bid:	Alternate #1: Generator at GHS	Alternate #2: Mechanical at GMS	Alternate #3: Structural Repairs/Crawl Sp.	Unit #1: Bar Joist Support:	Unit #2: GFI Duplex Outlet:	Unit #3: Maeonry Caulk:	Unit #4: Stucco Control Joint:	Unit #5: Stucco Expansion Joint:	TOTAL BID:
NO BID	ara, ka m amenen ja jala antanan ka				NO. NO. OF THE PARTY OF T			CONC. THE RESERVE OF THE PROPERTY OF THE PROPE	A STATE OF THE PARTY OF THE PAR
\$ 748,000	\$ 200,000	\$ 185,000	\$ 170,000	\$ 355.52	\$ 76.65	\$ 4.81	\$ 5.95	\$ 4.81	\$ 1,303,000
\$ 715,700	\$ 199,000	\$ 179,000	\$ 332,000	\$ 700.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 4.80	\$ 5.93	\$ 4.80	\$ 1,425,700
\$ 726,000	\$ 201,807	\$ 171,081	\$ 250,640	\$ 575.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 5.25	\$ 6.25	\$ 5.25	\$ 1,349,528
NO BID									
NO BID									
	NO BID \$ 748,000 \$ 715,700 \$ 726,000	Generator at GHS NO BID \$ 748,000 \$ 200,000 \$ 715,700 \$ 199,000 \$ 726,000 \$ 201,807	Generator at GMS NO BID \$ 748,000 \$ 200,000 \$ 185,000 \$ 179,000 \$ 726,000 \$ 201,807 \$ 171,081	Generator at GMS Structural Repairs/Crawl Sp. NO BID \$ 748,000 \$ 200,000 \$ 185,000 \$ 170,000 \$ 715,700 \$ 199,000 \$ 179,000 \$ 332,000 \$ 726,000 \$ 201,807 \$ 171,081 \$ 250,640 NO BID	Generator at GMS Structural Repairs/Crawl Sp. Bar Joist Support:	Separator at GHS Mechanical at GHS Structural Repairs/Crawl Sp. Bar Joist Support: Outlet:	Structural GMS Structural Repairs/Crawl Sp. Structural Support: GFI Duplex Gaulk:	Sepairal of the GMS	Generator at GMS Structural Repairs/Grawl Sp. Bar Joist Support: GFI Duplex Gaulic Supportion Joints: Property of the Control Joints Property of the Contr