



March 9, 2010

Board of Education  
Gadsden Independent School District  
PO Drawer 70  
Anthony, New Mexico 88021

**Re: Bidding**  
**Vado and Gadsden Elementary Schools Landscaping - 2010**  
**Gadsden Independent School District**  
**Anthony, NM**

Dear Board Members:

Six bids have been received as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheet for the above referenced project. The low bid of \$429,037.95 is from an Albuquerque firm, Accent Landscape Contractors. All six bids are within the project budget and reflect the current competitive bidding with pricing lower than expected.

Accent Landscaping has done excellent work for our office. They closely follow the drawings and specification requirements; and complete their projects consistently on time. We recommend acceptance of their bid and awarding them a contract for all bid lots. This award should be subject to not receiving any protests during the protest period of March 2 thru March 18, 2010.

If you have any questions regarding our recommendation please contact me at (575)523-1310.

Sincerely,

Rembert C. Alley, Jr.  
Alley Associates, P.C.

Cc: Steven Suggs  
Richard Chavez  
Ralph Gallegos



ALLEY ASSOCIATES  
ARCHITECT-PLANNERS

# BID TABULATION

1691 HICKORY LOOP, STE. A  
LAS CRUCES, NEW MEXICO  
88005  
Phone (575) 523-1310  
Fax (575) 523-1314  
General E-Mail  
ralley@qwestoffice.net

PROJECT: Vado and Gadsden Elementary Schools Landscaping - 2010

BID DATE: March 2, 2010

GAD2010-01

BID TIME: 2:00 PM

## CONTRACTOR:

	Bid Lot #1 Vado Base Bid	Bid Lot #2 Gadsden Base Bid	Bid Lot #3 Gadsden Add'l Playfield	Bid Lot #4 Gadsden ponding area	Bid Lot #5 Gadsden Playground area	Bid Lot #6 Gadsden Playground area	Total
Accent Landscape	\$196,869.00	\$143,976.00	\$49,736.00	\$10,686.95	\$13,975.00	\$13,795.00	\$429,037.95
Landscape & Design Center	\$177,187.27	\$189,831.34	\$73,948.00	\$12,561.19	\$17,603.37	\$22,394.12	\$493,525.29
Martinez Irrigation & Landscape	\$208,883.00	\$184,535.00	\$46,710.00	\$9,080.00	\$8,755.00	\$17,510.00	\$475,473.00
Oasis Landscape	\$199,300.00	\$152,700.00	\$52,300.00	\$24,600.00	\$18,700.00	\$36,800.00	\$484,400.00
The Greenhouse Inc.	\$217,950.00	\$184,229.00	\$59,693.00	\$9,132.00	\$15,712.00	\$18,015.00	\$504,731.00
White Sands Construction	\$233,400.00	\$98,400.00	\$57,000.00	\$9,000.00	\$14,000.00	\$27,000.00	\$438,800.00
CD General	NO BID						
Gencor Corp.	NO BID						
Recon Inc.	NO BID						
Renegade Construction	NO BID						